JOHNSON COUNTY, MISSOURI
TAX SALE SUMMARY
AUGUST 22, 2011

CLAIMED
CERT NO PROPERTY OWNER OFFER TAX, INT BID SURPLUS SURPLUS BIDDER NOTES
& FEES
011-001 BASS, JOSEPH H & SHIRLEY J 2nd 1,377.27 1,377.27 0.00 McCONVILLE, JASON
011-002 BATTLES, JOSEPHINE 2nd 2,726.81 NONE NO BID
011-003 CAVANAUGH, MICHAEL J & LOLITA G 381.54 381.54 0.00 BREITKREUTZ, COURTNEY
011-004 CHRISTOPHER GROUP INC, DAVID 2nd 5,444.42 NONE NO BID
011-005 COWELL, DAVID N & BARBARA J 1,749.35 1,749.35 0.00 SMARR, SUSAN
011-006 DIAMOND CONST ENTERPRISES, INC. 2nd 212.05 212.05 0.00 SADER, SCOTT
011-007 EISKINA, CHRISTOPHER 2nd 958.98 NONE NO BID
011-008 GUINN, DARICKL & INGER M 189.40 NONE NO BID
011-009 HALLAR, FLETCHER & NORA 1,505.90 NONE NO BID
011-010 HEDRICK, KELLI 1,606.12 1,606.12 0.00 SHORE, CHARLES
011-011 HINKLE, RICHARD R & LAURA L 1,334.47 NONE NO BID
011-012 JACKSON TRUST, KENNETH L & SHARON H 5,386.30 NONE NO BID
011-013 JAMES, BELINDA L 2nd 1,471.51 NONE NO BID
011-014 KURTZ, MELVIN LEE JR & MELISSA 1,643.65 NONE NO BID
011-015 LANGWORTHY, LILA L 473.63 NONE NO BID
011-016 MALCO REAL ESTATE INC. 2nd 23,976.17 NONE NO BID
011-017 NATIONS, ERVIND & ESTER F 1,899.87 NONE NO BID
011-018 PITTS, WILLIAM L 286.57 NONE NO BID
011-019 RAPID COMMUNICATIONS LLC 4,105.06 NONE NO BID
011-020 SHARP, CHARLES & TERRY 431.30 NONE NO BID
011-021 SHROYER, PAUL & LINDA 473.99 NONE NO BID
011-022 | SMITH, RUDOLPH & MARY 2,228.94 NONE NO BID
011-023 STOREN, HERBERT 385.67 385.67 0.00 PORTER, PATRICIA
011-024 | STOREN, HERBERT 88.45 225.00 136.55 PORTER, PATRICIA
011-025 STOWE, MATTHEW L & CHRISTI D 2nd 985.67 985.67 0.00 SEXTON, KYLE
011-026 TEVIS, ROBERT R JR & ANDREA L 2nd 3,389.45 NONE NO BID
011-027 WELCH, JOHN H JR 476.78 476.78 0.00 BOLYARD, DAVID
011-028 DANNER, ELVIS E & DYLAN HOYT 3rd 574.57 NONE NO BID
011-029 MATTHEWS FAMILY TRUST, PHILIP L 3rd 706.31 NONE NO BID
011-030 |PHELPS, LAVENA IMA 3rd 368.34 NONE NO BID
011-031 THOMAS,JR&BC 3rd 176.88) 176.88 0.00 BROWNING, BILLY JO Forfeit interest-fail to meet
deadlines for C. Deed
TOTALS 7,576.33 136.55
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