JOHNSON COUNTY, MISSOURI
TAX SALE SUMMARY
AUGUST 24, 2020

TS |TAX, INT CLAIMED
CERT NO|PROPERTY OWNER offer |& FEES BID SURPLUS |SURPLUS BIDDER NOTES
020-001 |ALLIANCE OF DIVINE LOVE CHAPEL 1202 11,306.35| 11,306.35 0.00 EDMISTON, JOHN H.
020-002 |FITZPATRICK, BRADLEY 5,681.63| 8,750.00 3,068.37 EDMISTON, JOHN H.
020-003 |MURRAY, MICHAEL A. & AMY L. 232.76 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2021 sale
020-004 |NICHOLSON ETAL, GOLDIE 4,969.89| 4,969.89 0.00 KOVAC, SHAWN
020-005 |REVEN, ERIC 6,956.36| 6,956.36 0.00 EDMISTON, JOHN H.
020-006 |SWEENEY, HELEN JOYCE 3,039.24| 4,400.00 1,360.76 KOVAC, SHAWN
020-007 |VILES, ROBERT W 3,120.77 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2021 sale
020-008 |VILES, ROBERT W 1,486.63| 2500.00* 0.00 DIXON, DUANE* Carried over to 2021 sale
020-009 |CAMPBELL, MATILDA & BF COOPER 2ND 742.38 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2021 sale
020-010 |MOORE, DEBORAH L. 2ND | 1,260.14| 2,250.00 989.86 JOHNSON, BRADLEY W
020-011 |SCHWARTZ, JEFFERY D 2ND | 2,425.24 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2021 sale
020-012 |WALLACE, WILLIAM R 2ND 507.79 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2021 sale
020-013 |ORR, LOUIS 3RD | 1,440.60 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2021 sale

*Bidder filed false affidavit in someone else's name and owes taxes in another county.

Sale invalidated per RSMo 140.190. Carried over to 2021 sale.




